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married diversion is called affair, a flirt, a small adventure, a moment of forgetfulness,
depending on taste or circumstance.

For the decent married couples such moments of forgetfulness is not allowed. It is their duty to
combat everything which would undermine their marriage. It is their duty to defend the honor
and purity of their home. Only the blind people can say that such friendships and acquaintances
do not do harm to their families. How many families fall materially and morally, how many are
destroyed and broken, one can attest to that just by reading the papers or observing the
surroundings. One does not play with fire unpunished. Present day morality does not have an
inkling how destructive are such relationships and how negatively they affect the children.
These children lose all the respect for family and marriage, their understanding and respect of
marriage and fidelity is shaky and their confidence in life and love is poisoned. We can credit the
pessimism of this generation to the fact that the sources of life are vitiated, that from earliest
years the children watched how human dignity was trampled on, that their faith in fidelity and
indissolubility was dying. True, life frequently breaks out of every right path. Then one must
bear, understand, help and right the way. But one can never call these false directions straight,
never cover evil and say it is good, because it only brings a family and marriage harm. It only
causes death. In any case, let the married couples remember that eternally binding admonition:
What God has joined, let no man put asunder!
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March 23, 1941
| greet you, my fellow compatriots, in a traditional Polish way: Praised be Jesus Christ!

In the last twenty years we heard enough about Communism. We read about Bolshevism!
Always and almost exclusively, however, we connected this subversive and bestial system with
material causes. We spoke of Bolshevism as a system which does not really differ much from
radicalism and anarchism irrespective of its relationship to real life issues, brings the countries
to ruin. We spoke of bolshevizing the mood of the country whether social mood or economic
mood. We did forget, however, that spiritual Communism was moving rapidly, almost with
lightning speed, and bolshevized minds, hearts and human souls. This Bolshevism inundated the
souls of some Christians, and invaded Catholic families. This Bolshevism permeated delicate
consciences and impressionable hearts. Bolshevism, generally understood, is a thief, a robber of
public good, leading to political and economic ruin. Bolshevism, whether it's mental, lodged in
the heart or spiritual demoralizes the foundation of social structure: namely, father, mother,
child. It is useless to continue to speak of saving the world’s edifice if we neglect to defend the
source of social and national life. This source is nothing else than the marriage, and, Christian
and holy marriage is Bolshevized. The concept and the true meaning of marriage is more and
more obscured. In these times nothing is so widely written about than marriage. Despite this,
though, nothing is less understood, more ignored and ill-treated than marriage. Should we be
surprise at this revelation? Not at all. The motive is clear. Because, from this marriage,
Bolsheviks snatched out Him, who instituted and consecrated marriage. Him who taught
marriage should be marked by unity, indissolubility and purity. The spiritual Bolsheviks wrote a
death decree to Christian and Catholic marriage — “today’s preached foundations are given as
results of modern teaching, such teaching whose main concern is establishing only the truth,
the truth which annihilates the wisdom of our ancestors. Amidst these ancient opinions of
marriage, the Bolsheviks reject and remove the traditional, Christian foundations of marriage.
This outlook is being inculcated in people of all social levels: the rich and the poor, single and
married, employees and their employers, educated and uneducated, pious and impious, adults
and youth!” That is why there are so many unhappy and insincere marriages. Thaat is why the
marriages have so many bloody tragedies!

“ - Bolshevized Marriages: - “

| am reading from a letter sent to me towards the end of February of the present year: “Some-
what longer than a year ago, | wrote to you, dear Father, about a certain couple who lived badly
with each other. She was a woman, who to defend a boarder, used very insulting words towards
her husband! Today, | am sending you, Father, a clip from the newspaper, describing the tragic
end of such bad life. The article is titled: “The Murderer Talks How He Killed His Wife!” These
two were known to me for | brought them two people together and was instrumental that they
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married. And certainly, after their parents, | deeply felt the tragic beginning of the end. And yet,
useless is the grief and sorrow for that which will never return. O, that no one may ever burden
is/her conscience with unworthy acts of his/her state.

The evil we cannot turn back, frequently we lack the strength
To repair bad acts is difficult
May every act and cause
Seek wisdom’s aid.
That which happened inadvertently —
Frequently is burdensome
May each think twice
Before acting!

May you, dear Father, comment on this tragic married life appropriately for the good of others.
Still, some people are definitely at fault, if God, who remembers His creatures whether at the
bottom of the sea or under an enormous rock. For without God’s will no hair falls from the
head. Every one of us has a Guardian Angel to watch over him. And yet despite these sublime
slogans it is going worse day by day. Humanity is going down to a greater villainy and man is
becoming more and more squalid. Would it be God’s wrath for humanity, because humans have
thrown Him out, the Creator of all, beyond the parenthetical reasoning, ethical feelings, and
understanding of God’s truths.!” —

This is what the simple, sincere and deeply believing man wrote to me. What he writes does
bring out one truth. God is not a dictator, but good and loving father. This God, in creating man,
does endow him with a soul, part of God’s own spirit. He gives this creature the power of reason
and the free will. He gives him/her conscience which acts as a guard, and which does not permit
itself to be bribed. Providence of God is not stingy in giving a man the graces he/she needs sot
that he/she may do good and avoid evil. We must remember that this man not infrequently
voluntarily rejects God and His care saying: that his reason is sufficient for him. Frequently he
chooses that which is “dressed in beautiful clothing of good and happiness and permits himself
to be deceived by outward appearance. Sometime despite the calls and admonitions of
conscience, man rejects that which the reason indicates and to which his will inclines and
stubbornly does not want to recognize the Lord over him, and does not want to see the Tablet
of Commandments before him, he leads a miserable, restless, unsatisfactory and unhappy life.
That which is verified on an individual is true of families, societies and whole humanity. This is
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the source of anger, hatred and suffering. Reasonable and free people, but because they abuse
the gifts of God, lead an unworthy life of a reasonable, free person! Someone had said that it is
such as these “lead a life of a brute and unfree.”

Now let us speak of the tragedy in a Polish family. “A man who wants to die in an electric chair
for the murder of his wife. He says he does not regret his action, because he knows he must die.
So said Sigismund Krajewski, a 52-year goldsmith from Wallingford, about the murder of his 42-
year wife, Maryanne, about dying in an electric chair. Krajewski was found guilty by the jury of
Grand Haven. Before that he confessed to the coroner, James J. Corrigan. Krajewski confessed
very calmly. He said that the motif for murder was the suspicion that his wife was unfaithful to
him and had a lover. Several times he followed her and even went to the house where she
frequently stayed, but was not allowed in. He was convinced that his wife was there even on the
night of murder. He went there but was not let in. Evidently his wife got frightened and ran
down the fire escape. Mrs. Krajewska was shot while in bed in her own home. She worked in a
clothing warehouse. She never returned home after work but spent her evenings meeting with
her friend. At least so thought her husband. Krajewski frequently reproached his wife but she
denied everything although she did admit that she prepared meals for her friend and would
personally deliver them to him. Krajewski did admit that he shot his wife twice from an old
revolver he had for years. Despite the misunderstandings they had between them they lived
under the same roof until the week before the murder when his wife told him to leave. On a
certain day he decided to return. Already then he intended to shoot his wife. He began to take
all his things out. It took him several hours. When he finally finished carrying everything out he
went into the parlor and not putting the lights on he sat down in the corner. He waited until
after midnight (12:30). Then he heard the doors squeak, his wife returned. He sat in the corner
very quietly, he didn’t even move. His wife went into her bedroom. He waited at least half an
hour longer. Then, holding the revolver in his hand he entered the bedroom and stood by the
bed. His wife, breathing heavily, slept peacefully on. He just stood there looking at the face of a
woman whom several years before he led to the altar. Evidently his wife sensed the danger, she
woke up and began screaming, and he as though in a dream pulled the trigger once and then
the second time. A red spot showed on her forehead. That’s where the first bullet entered. On
the left, from her chest came a stream of blood. That’s where the second bullet entered.
Krajewski left the bedroom and entered the guest room and lay down on the couch. The whole
earth was spinning under him. Various thoughts were hitting into him like a storm! His
imagination became very alive and in those few moments he saw his whole life from the
wedding day until now when he saw the drops of blood on his wife’s forehead. Years ago when
he stood on the threshold of marriage life seemed to be a beautiful rainbow which promised
happiness, satisfaction and success. Despite these promises what did life actually give him? Life
gave him constant disagreements, frequent anger, suspicions, cheatings, lack of confidence and
insincerity. He used to console himself that it has to get better, there has to be change for the
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better, and instead it grew worse from day to day! At this moment all he saw in retrospect is a
broken life, and before him the courtroom, the prison cell, the death row and the electric chair
— horrible, terrifying! Cold shivers went through his body. He moved his hand over his forehead.
He was surprised to feel the drops of perspiration on his forehead. Slowly, he rose from the
couch, pushed the hat on his head and slowly with heavy footsteps left. First he entered the
dining car and drank two cups of black, hot coffee. He sobered up. Without hesitation he
directed himself to the nearest police station. He stood before the captain’s desk and said
calmly: “Just now | shot my wife.” The captain asked: “Mortally?” He answered: “She didn’t
even move after that.” Krajewski then continued “She ran around other men, especially with a
certain goldsmith!” The captain told him he shouldn’t say any more until he speaks with his
attorney. Krajewski replied: “I don’t care about any privileges, because what | had gone through,
it doesn’t even pay to live!” The people, especially my neighbors, spoke loudly about my wife’s
conduct. One evening | followed her. When she entered the house of her friend who did not
enjoy a good reputation. | asked a certain policeman to come with me to her friend’s house, but
he refused, and counseled me to return home. But | walked the streets for a long time not
knowing what to do. Finally I returned home. My wife was already there. When | began to
reproach her, she replied “What of it? Perhaps in reality he means more in my life than you do.
You know that for years now we do not live like a married couple!” Krajewski also said that his
wife entered the plea for a civil divorce, and that he is not at all sorry that he shot her. Then he
said: “l am not asking the state for any consideration. | am expecting the verdict of death in the
electric chair! In spite all, | really loved my wife up to three weeks of her death. Even though |
suspected her that she grew apart from me more and more, | loved her. She was constantly
throwing it up to me that | married her only because she was a good cook and managed the
house well. She also complained that | did not buy her a car that is why she couldn’t go where
she wanted, as other women did, only had to sit at home.” So much for this marital tragedy.
Remember, that in this case | do not want to be the procurator-prosecutor, neither advocate-
defender, nor the juror, and much less a judge. | only confirm a sad and painful fact that took
place between two people, who lived in apparent, false marriage! In the end the wife died
tragically from the bullets of a revolver and the husband stands before the death cell and an
electric chair!

About fifteen (15) years ago H. Ealuscha , considering modern marriages wrote thus: “1
understood ideal can lead to catastrophe entire society, a warped ideal leads to bitter
disenchantment! A healthy realist is worth a hundred times more than a false idealist. But, who
is an idealist? An idealist is normally a person who wants to see everything better and more
beautiful than it is in reality, who denies the existence of all that is evil and ugly. Such an
idealist, usually around forty years old is already disillusioned, because, in reality, he was never
an idealist but simply a weak dreamer. A real idealist knows all aspects of life in their truth, he
accepts all with gratitude and loves everything, above all he never ceases to belive that beauty
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and good will prevail. A false idealist denies dark sides of life, whereas the true idealist knows
about them and immersed in the darkness joyfully awaits the first light of dawn. A person who
in marriage loses his idealism, because he has to admit, that after all, his chosen one is also a
human being and subject to everything that is human —was never a true idealist in the first
place. Unfortunately it is this false idealism that people most frequently bring into marriage.
Both people who marry bring into married life that ceremonial picture of love, in all its spring
beauty and always in the Sunday’s best. When one has to come down from this idealistic
pedestal and exchange it for the prosaic daily living the transition frequently is sad. He sees her
tired, silent and dressed in ordinary clothes and perhaps also a bit irritable. She sees him as a
doctor, an official or a buyer, worried, oppressed with the yoke of problems — that’s when this
sight becomes unbearable and both feel themselves cheated.

It is also false to consider a husband or wife as their own exclusive possession, and demand that
he or she has no other interests or thoughts that those common to both of them. Such a selfish
ideal of life is, from the beginning, destined to fail. The ideal of an absolute freedom is also false.
When each one in marriage goes in her or hi own direction it is difficult to imagine that they will
meet at some point. Those who see in love only eternal ecstasy, rapture and intoxication will be
disappointed. Whoever wishes that marital love will always burn with a bright flame better not
marry at all. Marriage demands a strong love, healthy and peaceful love, love so great that it
never stops believing even when it’s silent and peaceful, when it seems to be sleeping like the
deep waters which the wind cannot move. A healthy realism is one which takes life as God had
made it, a realism that can fall into the rhythm of actuality. Those who enter marriage should
look reality in the eyes, he/she should see things as they are, and in all things see the active
thought of God. The skies are not always blue. If they were, they would become a vault like a
lifeless desert. The farmer sows so that he could gather a crop, but for that he needs rain,
storms, even the snow and strong winds. It is not different in marriage. Here, too, from time to
time we need clouds so that we can adequately appreciate the sunshine.

Since the last thirty (30) years, there slips into marriage crafty thief. In modern language “that
third party” especially, when the marriage is slightly on the downside and begins to wobble a bit
or when one of the parties is bored, then, as if out of the earth appears that third person.
Sometimes it is the friend from childhood days, sometimes the best girlfriend, a colleague from
the club or a sports companion. It is then that one hears the exclamation, “My God, what is the
problem? Even the married woman can have a male friend.” Really, can? Modern people call it
friendship! O, friendship, how many sins are covered by your cape! In today’s marriages such
friendships happen easily. At the beginning all is beautiful, but little by little, that friend or that
“third” one takes up more and more space in the family. Soon that “third” becomes
indispensable. Our unconstrained and easy morality knows another type of the “third”. That one
doesn’t use the mask of friendship, but openly encroaches into the marriage. That type of




